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Your request: 

Dear Sir /Madam, 

Under the Freedom of Information act 2000 

Please provide the following  

1. A list of Borough/District Councils in England that have not yet declared a Climate 

Emergency  

2. A list of Parish/Town Councils in England that have not yet declared a Climate Emergency  

3. Top 10 List of Private Partnerships the CCC works with 

4. What affiliation the CCC has with The RSPB Charity number: 207076 

Kind regards  

[redacted] 

Our response: 

Thank you for your request. We have handled your request under the Freedom of Information Act 

2000 (FOIA). 

1. The CCC does not hold any data on which borough/district councils in England have/have 

not declared a Climate Emergency.  

2.  The CCC does not hold any data on which parish/town councils in England have/have not 

declared a Climate Emergency. 

3. The CCC does not have any private partnerships.  
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4. The CCC has no affiliation with the RSPB (charity number 207076). 

Information disclosed in response to this FOIA request is releasable to the public. In keeping with the 

spirit and effect of the FOIA and the government’s Transparency Agenda, this letter and the 

information disclosed to you may be placed on the CCC website, together with any related 

information that will provide a key to its wider context. No information identifying you will be placed 

on the CCC website.  

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal 

review. If you are not content with the outcome of the review, you may apply directly to the 

Information Commissioner for a decision. In keeping with our transparency policy, the information 

released to you will be published on www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not 

include your personal data.  

Kind regards, Climate Change Committee 
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