
 

 

 

Freedom of Information (FOI) Request  
Received: 1 May 2024 
 
Published: www.theccc.org.uk/about/transparency  

 
Date: 13 May 2024 
Ref:  Sent by email from enquiries@theccc.org.uk  
 

Your request: 

Hi,  
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would request you to respond to 
questions included in the attachment.  
 
For any reason if you are unable to open the attachment do let me know. I can 
then send the questions within the email itself. 
 
Please note: If you do not have records relating to the questions in the 
attachment, please pass on this request to your IT department to provide us with 
the required information. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Regards, 
 
 
Contents of attachment: 
 
Q1. Can you please list the number of devices deployed by your organisation for 
the following?  
Desktop PCs   
Laptops   
Mobile phones  
Printers   
Multi-functional devices (MFDs)  
Tablets  
Physical servers   
Storage devices (for example: NAS, SAN)  
Networking infrastructure (for example: Switches, Routers, Interfaces, Wireless 
Access points)  
Security infrastructure (for example: Firewalls, Intrusion Detection Systems (IDS), 
Virus monitoring tools)   
   
Q2. Does your organisation plan to procure any of the below enterprise 
applications or software, if yes, please provide information in the below format.  
 
Please note, if the applications you're planning to procure are not listed below 
then do mention them separately.  
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2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)  2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000)  
 
Content Management System     
Supply Chain Management (SCM)     
Inventory Management Software     
Enterprise Asset Management (EAM) Software      
Business Intelligence Systems     
Other software/apps (mention the name of the software)     
   
Q3. Do you have any plans to procure End user devices 
(desktop/laptop/tablet/mobile phones etc)? if yes, please provide information in 
the below format.  
2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)  2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000)  
 
Desktops     
Laptops     
Mobile Phones     
Tablets and Others (if Others, please specify)     
   
Q4. Do you have any plans to procure below services/softwares? if yes, please 
provide information in the below format.   
2024/25 Spend/Budget (£000)  2025/26 Spend/Budget (£000)  
 
Artificial Intelligence (AI)     
Cyber Security    
 

Our response: 

Thank you for your request. We have handled your request under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA). Please find our response below. 
 
Q1. Can you please list the number of devices deployed by your organisation for 
the following?  
Desktop PCs - 0  
Laptops - 64  
Mobile phones - 54  
Printers - 1  
Multi-functional devices (MFDs) - 0  
Tablets - 6  
Physical servers - 0  
Storage devices (for example: NAS, SAN) - 0  
Networking infrastructure (for example: Switches, Routers, Interfaces, Wireless 
Access points) - The CCC’s IT services are provided by Defra. As a result, the 
CCC does not hold this information. Contact Defra to get this information. 
Security infrastructure (for example: Firewalls, Intrusion Detection Systems (IDS), 
Virus monitoring tools) – The CCC’s IT services are provided by Defra. As a result, 
the CCC does not hold this information. Contact Defra to get this information. 
 
   
Q2. Does your organisation plan to procure any of the below enterprise 
applications or software, if yes, please provide information in the below format. 
The CCC’s IT services are provided by Defra and therefore any planned 
procurement is undertaken by Defra. As a result, the CCC does not hold this 
information. Contact Defra to get this information. 
 
   



 

Q3. Do you have any plans to procure End user devices 
(desktop/laptop/tablet/mobile phones etc)? if yes, please provide information in 
the below format.  
The CCC’s IT services are provided by Defra and therefore any planned 
procurement is undertaken by Defra. As a result, the CCC does not hold this 
information. Contact Defra to get this information.   
   
Q4. Do you have any plans to procure below services/softwares? if yes, please 
provide information in the below format.   
The CCC’s IT services are provided by Defra and therefore any planned 
procurement is undertaken by Defra. As a result, the CCC does not hold this 
information. Contact Defra to get this information. 

 

Information disclosed in response to this FOIA request is releasable to the public.  
In keeping with the spirit and effect of the FOIA and the government’s 
Transparency Agenda, this letter and the information disclosed to you may be 
placed on the CCC website, together with any related information that will 
provide a key to its wider context.  No information identifying you will be placed 
on the CCC website. 

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask 
for an internal review. If you are not content with the outcome of the review, you 
may apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. In keeping 
with our transparency policy, the information released to you will be published 
on www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not include your 
personal data.  

 

Kind regards,  
Climate Change Committee 
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