Climate Change Committee
10 South Colonnade,
Canary Wharf, London

E14 4PU

w theccc.org.uk

Freedom of Information (FOI) request

Received: 29 September 2024

Date: 13 November 2024
Ref: Sent by email from enquiries@theccc.org.uk
Published: www.theccc.org.uk/about/transparency

Your request:

| am contacting you for a freedom of information request regarding an explanation for the recent
flights of Bioflight aircraft P68 OY-VPA which was recently based at Southend Airport Essex UK over
the weekend of 14/15 of Sept 2024.

We have the caa temporary airspace documents for survey flights sponsored by APEM Itd over
both London and Oxford and also the adsb flight tracking data this is also being repeated today
29th Sept by two aircraft oy-yps and oy-vpd

Would you kindly explain

1. What is the nature and purpose of these flights?

2. What type of data is being collected (eg emissions or mapping of buildings or frees etc.and by
which type of onboard equipment eg Lidar

3. Finally can you please advise on who ultimately receives the data that these flights collect and
for what purpose is it being collected and used.

Many thanks in advance for your cooperation in this matter.
Regards

[redacted]

Our response:

Thank you for your request. We have handled your request under the Freedom of Information Act
2000 (FOIA).

1) The CCC does not hold any data relating to these flights.
2) The CCC does not hold any data relating to these flights.
3) The CCC does not know who may hold data on this.

Information disclosed in response to this FOl request is releasable to the public. In keeping with the
spirit and effect of the FOI and the government’s Transparency Agenda, this letter and the
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information disclosed to you may be placed on the CCC website, together with any related
information that will provide a key to its wider context. No information identifying you will be placed
on the CCC website.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal
review. If you are not content with the outcome of the review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner for a decision. In keeping with our fransparency policy, the information
released to you will be published on www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not
include your personal data.

Kind regards, Climate Change Committee
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